Bainbridge Township Service dpartment
Road Maintenance Material Bid Tabulation 2026

) . . Cuyahoga Asphalt Materials . Stoneco, Inc DBA Allied
D e Company Name Soltis and Sons Ent. LLC SelEEing Mistetiats, Ve, LLC. Shelly Materials, Inc. Corporation The Arms Trucking Co.
8920 Canyon Falls Blvd.
Company Address 3469 State Route 305 PO Box 334 PO Box 107 8920 Canyon Falls Blvd. #120 Suite#120 PO Box 369
Compnay City/State/Zip Southington, OH 44470 Fredericktown, OH 43019 Fredericktown, OH 43019 Twinsburg, OH 44087 Twinsburg, OH 44087 E. Claridon, OH 44033
Delivered Product Est. Qty. (tons) Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton Price Per Ton
#1 Limestone 250 $35.20 No Bid No Bid $35.95 No Bid $33.50
#2 Limestone 250 $35.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.40
#9 Limestone 100 $29.20 No Bid No Bid $31.05 No Bid $32.50
#57 Limestone 250 $35.20 No Bid No Bid $35.90 No Bid $32.95
#304 Limestone 500 $35.33 No Bid No Bid $25.30 No Bid $26.00
#411 Limestone 750 $36.33 No Bid No Bid $28.15 No Bid $28.70
#9 Wash gravel 250 $21.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.25 $19.95
#57 Wash gravel 250 $27.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.10 $28.75
Cinders 500 CALL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#601 B (12" x 24") 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.05 No Bid $65.90
#601 C (9" x 18") 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.05 No Bid $59.65
#601 D (4" x 8") 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid $63.35 No Bid $53.95
Picked Up Products Est. Qty. (tons)
#301 Asphalt Base ( Recycle) 500 No Bid $77.00 $77.00 No Bid $68.75 No Bid
#448-1 Asphalt Surface Limestone ( Recycle) 500 No Bid $89.00 $89.00 No Bid $81.75 No Bid
#448-2 Asphalt Base Limestone ( Recycle) 1,500 No Bid $79.00 $79.00 No Bid $69.75 No Bid
Picked Up Products Est. Qty. (tons)
#301 Asphalt Base (No Recycle) 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
#448-1 Asphalt Surface Limestone (No Recycle) 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
#448-2 Asphalt Base Limestone (No Recycle) 1,500 No Bid No Bid No Bid




